Me(D

MONTGOMERY COUNTY
TENNESSEE

Bid Tabulation
Bid Project: Traffic Paint
Department: Highway Department
Bid Opening Date: 5-18-26 at 10 a.m.

Bidder Name White Paint | Cost/Gal | Yellow Paint | Cost/Gal | Glass Beads

Cost/Ib

Allstate Coatings Co | 275 gal tote | $11.67 | 275 gal tote | $11.83 No Bid
Crown USA 275 gal tote | $10.82 | 275 gal tote | $10.82 S0.74
Ennis-Flint, Inc 275 gal tote | $11.25 | 275 gal tote | $11.25 No Bid
Gentem Ltd 250 gal tote | $11.30 | 250 gal tote | $11.30 S0.53
Potters Industries, LLC | 250 gal tote | $11.40 | 275 gal tote | $11.20 S0.65
Svevia USA Inc 250 gal tote | $15.13 | 250 gal tote | $15.19 $0.98
Swarco Industries LLC No Bid SO No Bid SO S0.66
The Sherwin-Williams | 275 gal tote | $11.20 | 275 gal tote | $11.75 S0.90
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