
Montgomery County Government 
Bid Tabulation 

 

Bid Project__Metal Pipe and Bands____________________ 
Department___Highway Department__________ 
Bid Opening Date__6-3-25 at 10 a.m._________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Bid Awarded to___Energy Culvert Company_____________ 
Date Bid Awarded___6-11-26_______ 

Pipe Size Bidder Unit Price Unit Price 
  CMP/LF Band/EA HDPE/LF Band/EA 
12” (16 gauge) Energy Culvert $14.77 $15.00 $6.04 $9.50 
15” (16 gauge) Energy Culvert $18.49 $19.00 $8.00 $14.24 
18” (16 gauge) Energy Culvert $22.15 $23.00 $11.09 $23.10 
24” (16 gauge) Energy Culvert $29.28 $30.00 $18.01 $34.10 
30” (14 gauge) Energy Culvert $43.82 $36.00 $25.42 $52.24 
36” (14 gauge) Energy Culvert $52.10 $43.00 $33.10 $58.90 
42” (14 gauge) Energy Culvert $60.78 $52.00 $50.04 $108.37 
48” (12 gauge) Energy Culvert $93.07 $56.00 $61.44 $123.40 
54” (12 gauge) Energy Culvert $116.75 $175.00 No Bid No Bid 
60” (12 gauge) Energy Culvert $129.41 $192.00 $103.30 $137.50 
66” (12 gauge) Energy Culvert No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
72” (12 gauge) Energy Culvert $154.82 $232.00 No Bid No Bid 
      


