NMe(CD

MONTGOMERY COUNTY

TENNESSEE

PURCHASING

Bid Tabulation

Bid Project: Hot Mix
Department: Highway Department
Bid Opening Date: 6-4-26 at 10 a.m.

Bid Item Rogers Group Byard McAsphalt LLC Vulcan
Construction Materials
Laid in Place per
ton
Hot Mix - CW $122.40 $105.00 No Bid $150.00
Hot Mix — Rap CW $114.50 $102.00 No Bid $148.00
Hot Mix - BM $113.80 $98.00 No Bid $130.00
Hot Mix - E $122.10 $112.00 No Bid $160.00
Hot Mix - D $144.85 $130.00 No Bid $160.00
Hot Mix - CS $128.30 $118.00 No Bid $165.00
Hot Mix — Rap BM $105.90 $95.00 No Bid $128.00
Picked Up
per ton
Hot Mix - CW $88.10 No Bid $75.00 $73.50
Hot Mix — Rap CW $80.65 No Bid $72.00 $71.50
Hot Mix - BM $80.75 No Bid $68.00 $70.25
Hot Mix - E $87.85 No Bid $82.00 $84.00
Hot Mix - D $109.40 No Bid $92.00 $90.00




Hot Mix - CS

$91.45

No Bid

$88.00

$88.00

Hot Mix — Rap BM

$75.00

No Bid

$65.00

$68.25




