
Montgomery County Highway Department 
FY26 Hot Mix Bid Tab 

 
Bid Item Rogers Group Byard 

Construction 
McAsphalt LLC US Home 

Solutions 
Vulcan 

Materials 
      

Laid in Place 
per ton 

     

Hot Mix  - CW $110.05 $105.00 No Bid No Bid $110.00 
Hot Mix – Rap CW $103.50 $103.00 No Bid No Bid $110.00 

Hot Mix - BM $102.30 $100.00 No Bid No Bid $110.00 
Hot Mix - E $109.55 $110.00 No Bid No Bid $120.00 
Hot Mix - D $134.75 $135.00 No Bid No Bid $128.00 

Hot Mix - CS $115.30 $120.00 No Bid No Bid $125.00 
Hot Mix – Rap BM $95.70 $98.00 No Bid No Bid $110.00 

      

Picked Up 
per ton 

     

Hot Mix  - CW No Bid No Bid $75.00 $115.75 $70.50 
Hot Mix – Rap CW No Bid No Bid $73.00 $115.75 $68.50 

Hot Mix - BM No Bid No Bid $72.00 $105.00 $63.00 
Hot Mix - E No Bid No Bid $80.00 $115.00 $80.00 
Hot Mix - D No Bid No Bid $95.00 $150.00 $88.00 

Hot Mix - CS No Bid No Bid $85.00 $118.00 $84.00 
Hot Mix – Rap BM No Bid No Bid $70.00 $105.00 $61.00 

      

 


